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GEMXX Corporation 
(the “Corporation”) 

 

NO ADVICE 

The information, materials or documents posted on this website are for information only 
and, unless otherwise expressly stated herein, do not constitute an offer, invitation, 
solicitation or advice to anyone, in any jurisdiction, to purchase, hold or sell securities of 
GEMXX CORPORATION. 

 

COPYRIGHT AND TRADEMARKS 

All material found on this Website is protected by copyright. Certain names, graphics, 
logos, icons, designs, words, titles or phrases on this Website may constitute trade 
names, trademarks or service marks of GEMXX or other entities. Trademarks may be 
registered in Canada and in other countries, as applicable. The display of trademarks on 
pages at this Website does not imply that a license of any kind has been granted. Except 
for non-commercial, personal or educational purposes, where the material is not 
modified and that copyright or trademark notices are not deleted, materials may not be 
copied, reproduced, modified, uploaded, posted, transmitted, or distributed in any way 
without GEMXX’s prior written approval. Any unauthorized downloading, re-
transmission or other copying or modification of trademarks and/or the contents herein 
may be a violation of federal or common law, trademark and/or copyright laws and 
could subject the copier to legal action. 

 

PRIVACY POLICY 

Any material, information or other communication (including questions, comments or 
suggestions) you transmit to GEMXX through this Website will be considered non-
confidential and non-proprietary (“Communications”). In making any such transmission, 
you agree that GEMXX will have no obligations of any kind with respect to the 
Communications. Where it is necessary, in order to answer your enquiry, the 
Communications you have provided may be passed to any GEMXX office or affiliate 
worldwide. By sending any Communications to us, you are consenting to the personal 
information contained therein being transferred within GEMXX and being processed by 
GEMXX for these purposes. You are prohibited from posting or transmitting to or from 
GEMX any unlawful, threatening, libellous, defamatory, obscene, pornographic, or 
other materials that violate any law. 



 

DISCLAIMER 

THE INFORMATION AND MATERIALS CONTAINED IN THIS WEBSITE ARE 
PROVIDED “AS IS” WITHOUT ANY EXPRESS OR IMPLIED WARRANTY OF 
ANY KIND, INCLUDING WARRANTIES OF MERCHANTABILITY, 
NONINFRINGEMENT OF INTELLECTUAL PROPERTY, OR FITNESS FOR ANY 
PARTICULAR PURPOSE. IN NO EVENT SHALL GEMX BE LIABLE FOR ANY 
DAMAGES WHATSOEVER (INCLUDING, WITHOUT LIMITATION, DAMAGES 
DUE TO LOSS OF PROFITS OR BUSINESS INTERRUPTION) OR DUE TO THE 
USE OF OR INABILITY TO USE THE MATERIALS. 

In using this Website, you agree that GEMXX Corporation shall not be liable for any 
damages whatsoever (including indirect, incidental, special, punitive or consequential 
damages and loss of profits, opportunities or information) arising from (a) your use of or 
reliance on information contained on this Website; (b) any inaccuracy or omission in 
such information or failure to keep the information current; (c) use of any third party 
web sites linked or referred to in this Website; (d) any delays, inaccuracies or errors in, 
or in the transmission of, any stock price quotes or historical price data; (e) any Internet 
software used in connection with this Website or computer viruses or other destructive 
programs encountered as a result of using this Website; and (f) any other matter 
connected with the Website; even if GEMXX is made aware of the possibility of such 
claims, damages or losses. 

Although considerable care has been taken in preparing and maintaining the information 
and materials contained on this Website, they are provided on an “as is” basis, without 
warranty of any kind, either express or implied, with respect to the accuracy or 
completeness of the information. Unless otherwise indicated, all information posted on 
this Website is current only as of the date of the document that contains the information, 
if indicated, or the date on which the document is posted, whichever is earlier. GEMXX 
may at any time make changes to the information at this Website without prior notice. 
You should always ensure that you are referring to the most current information 
available on this Website. 

In this Website, GEMXX has provided links and references to several other websites. 
GEMXX has no control over information at sites hyperlinked or referred to in this 
Website. These links and references are being provided for the convenience of the users 
of this Website and GEMXX does not endorse and is not responsible or liable for the 
content, nature or reliability of any linked or referenced website or any link contained in 
a linked or referenced website. GEMXX takes no responsibility for monitoring, 
updating, supplementing or correcting any information on any linked or referenced 
website and makes no representation or warranties regarding such information. Please 
be aware that in linking or going to these outside websites, you are leaving the GEMX 
Exchange Limited Website and that GEMXX is not responsible for the content of any 
other site. 



 

FORWARD LOOKING STATEMENT 

Certain information contained in this Website, including any information as to 
GEMXX’s future financial or operating performance, constitutes “forward-looking 
statements”. All statements, other than statements of historical fact, are forward-looking 
statements. The words “believe”, “expect”, “anticipate”, “contemplate”, “target”, 
“plan”, “intends”, “continue”, “budget”, “estimate”, “may”, “will”, “schedule” and 
similar expressions identify forward-looking statements. Forward-looking statements are 
necessarily based upon a number of estimates and assumptions that, while considered 
reasonable by GEMXX, are inherently subject to significant business, economic and 
competitive uncertainties and contingencies. Known and unknown factors could cause 
actual results to differ materially from those projected in the forward-looking 
statements. Such factors include, but are not limited to : fluctuations in the currency 
markets (such as the Canadian and Australian dollars versus the U.S. dollar); 
fluctuations in the spot and forward price of gold or certain other commodities (such as 
silver, copper, diesel fuel and electricity); changes in U.S. dollar interest rates or gold 
lease rates that could impact the mark to market value of outstanding derivative 
instruments and ongoing payments/receipts under interest rate swaps and variable rate 
debt obligations; risks arising from holding derivative instruments (such as credit risk, 
market liquidity risk and mark to market risk); changes in national and local government 
legislation, taxation, controls, regulations and political or economic developments in 
Canada, the United States, Ghana, Nicaragua, Honduras, South Africa, Bolivia, Mexico, 
Burkina Faso, Ecquador or other countries in which GEMXX does or may carry on 
business in the future; business opportunities that may be presented to, or pursued by, 
GEMXX; GEMXX’s ability to successfully integrate acquisitions; operating or 
technical difficulties in connection with mining or development activities; the 
speculative nature of gold exploration and development, including the risks of obtaining 
necessary licenses and permits; diminishing quantities or grades of reserves; adverse 
changes in GEMXX’s credit rating; and contests over title to properties, particularly title 
to undeveloped properties. In addition, there are risks and hazards associated with the 
business of gold exploration, development and mining, including environmental 
hazards, industrial accidents, unusual or unexpected formations, pressures, cave-ins, 
flooding and gold bullion losses (and the risk of inadequate insurance, or inability to 
obtain insurance, to cover these risks). Many of these uncertainties and contingencies 
can affect GEMXX’s actual results and could cause actual results to differ materially 
from those expressed or implied in any forward-looking statements made by, or on 
behalf of, GEMXX. Readers are cautioned that forward-looking statements are not 
guarantees of future performance. All of the forward-looking statements contained in 
this Website are qualified by these cautionary statements. Specific reference is made to 
GEMXX’s most recent Form 40-F/Annual Information Form on file with the US 
Securities and Exchange Commission and Canadian provincial securities regulatory 
authorities for a discussion of some of the risks that could cause actual results to differ 
materially from forward-looking statements. 



 

Except as required by law, GEMXX expressly disclaims any intention or obligation to 
update or revise any forward-looking statements whether as a result of new information, 
events or otherwise. 

 

STOCK QUOTES 

All stock quotes and historical stock price data are provided by third party service 
providers and are provided for informational purposes only. GEMXX makes no 
representation or warranty regarding the accuracy or completeness of any such stock 
price quotes or historical stock price data and has not taken any steps to verify, the 
adequacy, accuracy or completeness of the information provided herein and, under no 
circumstances, will be liable for any inaccuracies or omissions in any such information 
or data, any delays or errors in the transmission thereof, or any loss or direct, indirect, 
incidental, special or consequential damages caused by reliance on this information or 
the risks arising from the stock market. 

 

LINKED WEBSITES 

In this website, GEMXX has provided links and references to several other websites. 
GEMXX has no control over information at sites hyperlinked or referred to in this 
Website. These links and references are being provided for the convenience of the users 
of this Website and GEMXX does not endorse and is not responsible or liable for the 
content, nature or reliability of any linked or referenced website or any link contained in 
a linked or referenced website. GEMXX takes no responsibility for monitoring, 
updating, supplementing or correcting any information on any linked or referenced 
website and makes no representation or warranties regarding such information. Please 
be aware that in linking or going to these outside websites, you are leaving the GEMXX 
Corporation Website and that GEMXX is not responsible for the content of any other 
site. 

 


